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Jobs

Start your future with BRAUN Lighting Solutions

For more than 20 years, BRAUN Lighting Solutions has been
planning, producing and distributing innovative lighting for
indoor and outdoor applications. With our energy-efficient and
low-maintenance LED technology, we renew or modernise the
lighting installations and street lighting systems of our
customers from the public sector or private industry. Our
workplaces are, for example, public roads, airports or industrial
and production halls. We help our customers to save energy
and thus CO2 and to significantly improve their environmental
balance.

With creative ideas and new products, we are constantly
pushing into new areas and inspiring new customer groups
with our solutions. We are a family business and are convinced
that innovative strength, courage and team spirit are important
factors for success in a rapidly changing world. Our tools are a
profound knowledge of materials and technologies, short
decision-making processes and the enthusiasm to change
things and make them better.

Through our ideas, we help shape the climate change and can
offer you a dynamic and healthy working environment with
interesting tasks. With us, the employee is not simply a
resource, but a member of our working community, which is
constantly developing and growing.

Do you want to make a difference? Then become an energetic
reinforcement of our committed, friendly team and develop
new perspectives with us!

Our career opportunities:

Installer, electrician, electrical helper

Businesswoman/-man for back office in sales and online shop

Please send us your complete application documents by e-mail
to personal@braun-lighting.com. We are also happy to receive
unsolicited applications.

https://braun.lighting/wp-content/uploads/2023/06/Stellenausschreibungen_2021-ENG-Installer-Electrician.pdf
https://braun.lighting/wp-content/uploads/2023/06/Stellenausschreibungen_2021-ENG-Back-Office-Sales.pdf
https://braun.lighting/wp-content/themes/braun/personal@braun-lighting.com
https://braun.lighting

